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Since the 1960s, the New Hampshire
landscape has been the scene of a tug-of
war between residential and commer-
cial development on the one hand and
protecting and conserving land on the
other.

In a report to the NH Association of
Realtors last year, Richard England,

emeritus professor of
economics and natural
resources at the Univer-
sity of New Hampshire,
tracked this ebb and flow
of land to inventory the
extent of buildable land
in light of the current
housing shortage.

“I’m an environmentalist,” said Eng-
land, but he questions, “is it possible to
be too successful when pursuing a wor-
thy goal like land conservation?” Pro-
tecting buildable land from develop-
ment, he explained, bears an opportuni-
ty cost, specifically diminished capacity
to provide affordable housing. Plentiful
economic research, he said, shows that
overly strict land-use regulations con-
tribute to rising land values, home
prices and rents.

During the last half of the 20th centu-
ry, the state’s population more than
doubled, from 533,242 in 1950 to
1,235,786 in 2000, posting double-digit
percentage increases in five consecu-
tive decades, including increases of
more than 20 percent in the 1960s, 1970s
and 1980s.

Population growth was most robust
in the southeastern counties — Hills-
borough, Rockingham and Merrimack
— where construction of Interstate 95,
the Everett and Spaulding Turnpikes
and I-93 drew migrants from Massa-
chusetts to jobs in expanding industries
in New Hampshire and workers com-
muting to metropolitan Boston.

England notes the Natural Resources
Conservation Service did not begin
tracking changes in land usage until
1982, when the first Natural Resources
Inventory was issued. The inventory
found that between 1982 and 1992, when
New Hampshire’s population grew 20
percent, the total developed area of the
state increased at twice that pace and
developed tracts of 10 acres or more in-
creased by 55 percent. The developed
area increased 51 percent in Hillsbor-
ough County, 40 percent in Rockingham
County and 35 percent in Merrimack
County.

The response from municipal and
state governments, bolstered by advo-
cacy and initiatives of environmental
and conservation organizations, was
immediate and aggressive. Prior to 1950,

only 20 municipalities — Keene, Man-
chester, Nashua and Concord among
them — had enacted zoning ordinances.
By 1980, 131 cities and towns had fol-
lowed suit, and by 2000 184 of the 234
municipalities had zoning regulations
in place.

In 1963, the Legislature authorized
municipalities to establish conserva-
tion commissions, which would be re-
quired to “keep an index of all open
space and natural, aesthetic or ecologi-
cal areas within the city or town.” Sub-
sequent legislation empowered conser-
vation commissions to acquire land,
through donations, purchases or ease-
ments, in the name of municipalities to
forestall its development. Since Hollis
convened the first conservation com-
mission in 1963, 215 cities and towns
have followed in its footsteps.

The current use program, in which
more than half the land in the state is
enrolled, has proved the most expansive
countermeasure to population growth
and land development.

In 1968, SPACE, a broad coalition of
environmental, agricultural and recre-
ational organizations, championed a
constitutional amendment to allow land
to be assessed at its current use rather
than fair market value, which carried by
an overwhelming margin of 2-1.

Five years later, the Legislature en-
acted a statute requiring forest, farm
and wetland parcels of 10 acres or more
be assessed at their current use, not
market, value. The current use program
provides landowners with tax incen-
tives so long as they defer development
of their land, without however prohib-
iting them from developing their prop-
erty in the future.

In 2019, the 3,001,655 acres enrolled
in the current use program represented
more than half the entire land area of
the state. Almost half this acreage is in
the three northernmost counties: Coos,
Grafton and Carroll. In the three south-
ern counties, acreage in current use ac-
counts for 46 percent of the land in
Hillsborough County, 33 percent in
Rockingham County and 57 percent in
Merrimack County.

Apart from steps taken by state and
local government, several nonprofit cor-
porations have either acquired property
or brokered easements to forestall de-
velopment of land.

The Society for the Protection of New
Hampshire Forests, formed in 1901, was
instrumental in creating the White
Mountain National Forest in 1918 as well
as sparing iconic landscapes — among
them Mount Sunapee, Mount Monad-
nock, and Franconia Notch — from log-
ging and development. Altogether, the
society owns some 56,000 acres, and
since 1971 has negotiated conservation

easements with private landowners on
more than 700 properties covering
132,786 acres and deed restrictions on
another 94 properties covering 13,377
acres.

The Nature Conservancy has had a
hand in protecting more than 300,000
acres of ecologically sensitive land
across the state while New Hampshire
Audubon owns 7,400 acres outright and
has easements on another 2,500 acres,
much of both serving as wildlife sanctu-
aries.

Since 2000, a falling birth rate, dwin-
dling migration and scant immigration
have slowed population growth, and the
pace of land development has slowed
with it. The percentage increase in de-
veloped acreage from 2002 to 2012 was
8.2 percent, less than half the 19.6 per-
cent of the prior decade and between
2012 and 2017 it fell to 1.4 percent, less
than the increase in population.

As growth slowed, home prices stabi-
lized, then fell, with the Great Recession
in 2008 before beginning to rise in 2013,
and since then the median sales price of
single-family homes has more than
doubled. Meanwhile, as home prices
flattened and fell, residential building
permits plummeted from near 750 units
in 2004 to less than 200 in the depth of
the recession, and despite recent re-
bounding has yet to reach half the num-
ber of 2004.

England asks whether, despite esti-
mates of a housing shortage of some
20,000 to 30,000 units and the robust
demand for single-family homes, con-
dominiums and rental units, housing
construction has been constrained for
want of buildable land, particularly in
the three southern counties.

England begins with the 5,941,000
acres of total surface area of the state,
then discounts the 224,000 acres of
lakes, ponds and rivers, leaving
5,617,000 of land area. The federal gov-
ernment owns 802 of them, most forest-
ed. 

The state and municipalities hold
572,000 acres as forests, parks and na-
ture preserves. And 737,000 acres had
been developed by 2017. This leaves un-
developed land not owned by federal,
state or municipal governments of
about 3.6 million acres, or 60 percent of
the total surface area of the state.

The 3,001,000 privately owned acres
enrolled in current use represents the
largest share of undeveloped land. This
acreage does not include land eligible
but not enrolled in current use and land
enrolled in current use but further re-
stricted by conservation easements.
Moreover, England estimates that some
281,000 of these acres — barrens, pas-
tures and marshland — are not suited
for development, and another 723,000

acres of privately owned land are sub-
ject to conservation restrictions.

Altogether, discounting for land al-
ready developed, owned by the govern-
ment, deemed unbuildable and subject
to restrictions, England estimates there
are more than 2.6 million acres of “phys-
ically and legally buildable plots of land
in private ownership.” This, he says,
“seems to be more than enough land to
support new home construction for dec-
ades to come.”

He assumes “a substantial portion of
the private land without conservation
restrictions that is currently enrolled in
the current use program would be avail-
able for development — at the right
price.”

Likewise, England finds there is no
shortage of land for development in the
three southern counties, which are
home to more than half the state’s pop-
ulation. He estimates that “physically
and legally buildable land” amounts to
206,000 acres in Hillsborough County,
167,000 in Rockingham County and
331,000 acres in Merrimack County. In
all three counties, the acreage of avail-
able land is greater than that of devel-
oped land, and in Merrimack County it
is fourfold greater.

However, England writes, “there is
still room in New Hampshire for con-
struction of new housing, but the land
use regulatory system that was created
during the late 20th century will have to
be reformed if those new homes are to
be built.”

He suggests that simply “preserving
open space” is insufficient to forestall
development and recommended local
officials “demonstrate the ecological
value of protecting land.”

Referring to a study of 24 metropol-
itan areas, England says, “a causal rela-
tionship” has been demonstrated be-
tween strict land-use regulation and the
rising costs of land and housing.

In particular, he questions the impo-
sition of two-acre minimum lot sizes,
which leads to construction of expen-
sive homes spread across large tracts,
all but excluding housing for low- and
middle-income households while con-
suming displacing open space with
sprawl.

England asks that, while restrictive
zoning regulations and aggressive con-
servation efforts made sense amid rapid
population growth and development,
“isn’t it time to pause, take a deep breath
and discuss how to strike a balance be-
tween protection of rural land and pro-
duction of affordable housing?”

These articles are being shared by
partners in The Granite State News Col-
laborative. For more information visit
collaborativenh.org.

UNH prof links land conservation to higher housing costs
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WASHINGTON – Five weeks ago,
senior Biden administration aides gath-
ered for their regular Thursday morning
meeting about passing a bill to revive
the U.S. computer chip sector, worried
that it could be in peril.

After 18 months, the bipartisan effort
to provide $52 billion for semiconduc-
tors was getting close to the finish line.
But they knew Senate Republican Lead-
er Mitch McConnell might block it.

This was not just another would-be-
nice bill. Many in the meeting had sat
through multiple briefings about fright-
ening scenarios if the deal stalled. They
were convinced the very trajectory of
the economy and national security was
at stake.

The billions for computer chips and
scientific research, they argued, could
help to cut inflation, create jobs, defend
the U.S. and allies and preserve an edge
over China.

More than 90% of advanced chips
come from Taiwan. Should Taiwan be
invaded or shipping channels closed,
much of the world would face a cascad-
ing economic crisis and become unable
to maintain chips-dependent weapons
systems.

The Biden team resolved to ignore
any McConnell threats and keep work-
ing with Republican senators who had
backed the bill.

Brian Deese, director of the White
House National Economic Council, re-
called the sentiment coming out of the
meeting: “There’s been too much pro-
gress, too much trust and there’s too
much at stake” to see failure now.

Just hours later, McConnell vowed
the semiconductor bill would be dead if
Democratic senators tried to push
through a separate spending package
on a party-line vote. His gambit would
ultimately fail.

President Joe Biden will soon sign
into law the $280 billion CHIPS and Sci-

ence Act. This account of how the bill
came together draws from interviews
with 11 Biden administration and con-
gressional officials, most speaking on
condition of anonymity to discuss pri-
vate conversations.

The back story reveals the complex-
ities of bipartisanship even when all
sides agree on the goal.

McConnell threatened to block the
bill even though he supported the idea,
hoping to head off separate Democratic
legislation. Biden’s team took the un-
usual step of enlisting Trump admini-
stration veterans to help find Republi-
can votes. 

For much of the time, the technical
nature of the subject meant the talks
could occur beyond the din of partisan
squabbling. Both sides knew govern-
ment-funded research eventually led to
the internet, MRIs, coronavirus vac-
cines and other innovations that shape
today’s world. It was only toward the
end that the politics flared.

Administration officials say the bill
cleared Congress last week because of a
deep coalition and persistence. But
many Republicans believe they provid-
ed key support, only to be double-
crossed.

McConnell’s two-week blockade
ended after West Virginia Sen. Joe Man-
chin said on July 14 he largely opposed
his fellow Democrats’ spending and tax
plans. Assuming Biden’s broader agen-

da was on ice, Senate Republicans could
confidently vote for the computer chips
bill. 

But four hours after the bill passed
the Senate on July 27, Manchin an-
nounced a deal with Senate Democratic
Leader Chuck Schumer to support the
kind of broad package McConnell had
wanted to stop. The package commits
hundreds of billions to fight climate
change, lower prescription drug prices
and would raise some corporate taxes.

That endangered the chip bill in the
House. But 24 Republicans joined Dem-
ocrats in passing it there.

It had all begun in an Oval Office
meeting with lawmakers a month into
Biden’s presidency. Existing law ap-
proved investing in semiconductor de-
velopment, but Congress still had to ap-
propriate the money.

The issue stayed largely in the back-
ground as the president pushed a coro-
navirus relief package through Con-
gress in March 2021, then turned his at-
tention to infrastructure and an expan-
sive domestic agenda.

But the risks from computer chip
shortages became clearer as inflation
kept rising last year. A federal survey
from September showed that manufac-
turers were down on average to just a
five-day supply of chips, compared with
40 days pre-pandemic.

On June 8, 2021, the Senate passed
its version of the semiconductor bill and
the House followed suit eight months
later. But key differences in the bills
would have to be reconciled, and that’s
where things often get sticky.

Biden used his State of the Union ad-
dress in March to highlight an an-
nouncement by Intel to invest in what
could be eight semiconductor plants in
Ohio – a commitment that was contin-
gent on final passage of the bill. 

Deese and Commerce Secretary Gina
Raimondo intensified their outreach af-
ter the speech and more top aides got in-
volved. Internal White House records
show 85 meetings and events involving

companies and stakeholders since the
start of this year.

Biden’s team also enlisted help from
Trump administration veterans, among
them two former national security ad-
visers. The commerce secretary cold-
called Mike Pompeo, Trump’s former
secretary of state, who had been critical
of Biden in a February speech.

“I’m always happy to help a fellow
Italian,” Raimondo recalled Pompeo
saying after she asked for his assis-
tance. 

By Raimondo’s count, she had 250
meetings with businesses and outside
groups and roughly 300 meetings or
calls with lawmakers on the bill.

Meanwhile, Russia’s invasion of Uk-
raine had driven up energy and fuel
costs, a reminder of the havoc that
would occur if access to semiconductors
were further disrupted. 

In June, Intel announced it would
postpone its first Ohio plant because the
bill had not passed. Then McConnell de-
cided to halt negotiations. Days later,
France announced a new semiconduc-
tor plant made possible by the European
Union’s own investment.

Raimondo felt a pit in her stomach af-
ter learning of McConnell’s decision but
kept calling Republicans. “Just constant
engagement,” she recalled.

The Senate ultimately passed the bill
when it appeared the separate Demo-
cratic agenda package was going no-
where. But after Manchin revived it
with his Schumer deal, House Republi-
cans mounted a last-minute push to
stop the chips bill. Still, it passed as a
bipartisan win.

Some Republicans felt betrayed. Tex-
as Sen. Cornyn had been a driving force
behind the chips bill, yet said Manchin
had undermined the ability to negotiate
in good faith. “That trust was eviscerat-
ed,” he said.

Raimondo sized up the achievement
this way: “It takes a little bit longer than
it should, a lot more drama than you
would like, but it happens.”

Bumps, bipartisanship in long fight for semiconductor bill
Josh Boak 
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President Joe Biden and South Korean
President Yoon Suk Yeol visit the
Samsung Electronics campus May 20 in
Pyeongtaek, South Korea. AP


